
Glory be to Allah, all praise is due to Allah, there is no god but Allah, Allah is the Greatest, 
and there is no power nor might except with Allah. 

O Allah, send blessings and peace upon our Prophet Muhammad and his family.  

O Allah, we turn to You in this blessed night, so aid us and accept our supplications. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from the trial of the Fire and the punishment of the Fire, 
from the trial of the grave and the punishment of the grave, and from the evil of the trials of 
wealth and poverty. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from an evil day, an evil night, an evil hour, an evil 
companion, and an evil neighbor in our place of residence. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from the evil of our hearing, the evil of our sight, the evil of 
our tongues, the evil of our limbs, and the evil of our hearts. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from arrogance in wealth and humiliation in poverty.  

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from evil morals, deeds, desires, and diseases. We seek 
refuge in You from leprosy, insanity, and all severe illnesses. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from miserliness, we seek refuge in You from cowardice, 
and we seek refuge in You from a miserable old age. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from the evil that enters the earth and what emerges from 
it, and we seek refuge in You from falling from heights, from destruction, drowning, 
burning, and we seek refuge in You from being seized by Satan at the time of death. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from a heart that does not humble itself, from a 
supplication that is not heard, from a soul that is never satisfied, and from knowledge that 
does not benefit.  

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from these four. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from hunger, for it is a terrible companion, and we seek 
refuge in You from treachery, for it is an evil traitor. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from laziness and senility, and we seek refuge in You from 
being returned to the worst of age. We seek refuge in You from the trial of the Dajjal and 
from the trials of life and death. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from the plotting of plotters, the oppression of the 
oppressors, the deception of deceivers, the envy of the envious, the magic of the 
sorcerers, the transgression of the wicked, the bad character of the hypocrites, and the 
hypocrisy of those who show off, O Lord of the worlds. 

O Allah, we seek refuge in You from envy, we seek refuge in You from lying, we seek refuge 
in You from gossip, we seek refuge in You from backbiting, we seek refuge in You from 
showing off, we seek refuge in You from loving reputation, we seek refuge in You from 



looking down on others, we seek refuge in You from an unrestrained tongue, and we seek 
refuge in You from lack of modesty. We seek refuge in You from putting Your servants to 
trial or being put to trial ourselves, and we seek refuge in You from all despicable traits. 

O Allah, protect us from all that we have sought refuge from, and increase us in Your 
bounty and mercy, O Most Merciful of the merciful. 

Glorified is your Lord, the Lord of Honor and Power, above what they attribute to Him. And 
peace be upon the messengers, and all praise is due to Allah, the Lord of the worlds. 

O Allah, send blessings and peace upon our Prophet Muhammad, his family, and his 
companions. 

 
 


